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that public records related
be made available under t
be considered a demand f
pursuant to the Criminal R
the extent the Criminal Ru
indicate a contrary intent. 
counsel of the defendant , 
defendant making a reque
division shall serve a copy 
on the prosecuting attorne
law, or other chief legal o�
for prosecuting the action.

Speci�c Information on Requested Records
If applicable to your request, enter speci�c information below to assist with locating you
records.

Case/Incident Number: For requests directed to th
Police, please include the i
number(XX-XXXXXX)

Plate Number: Please make sure to includ
when requesting accident 

Incident Location: If applicable to your reque
Location if known.

Incident Date: MM/DD/YYYY format or se
drop-down arrow.

Incident Time: If applicable to your reque
Time if known.

Involved Parties: Daniel Piper
If applicable to your reque
of Involved Parties if know

Phone Number: If requesting 911 records, 
phone number from which
placed, if available.

Your records will be provided electronically via the Public Records Center
specify an alternate delivery method below. There will be a charge for ph

Alternate Delivery Method: No Alternate Method

Send a New Message  Go Back



 PriMessages 4

 On 5/13/2021 11:53:33 AM, Cleveland Public Records Center wrote:

Click Here to View Entire Message

 On 5/13/2021 11:36:58 AM, Cleveland Public Records Center wrote:

 On 5/13/2021 11:35:08 AM, Cleveland Public Records Center wrote:

 On 5/13/2021 11:35:07 AM, Cleveland Public Records Center wrote:

javascript:;
javascript:;
javascript:;
javascript:;
javascript:void(0);


SAFETY PERSON INFO









SAFETY PERSON INFO

SAFETY PERSON INFO

















ACCT# BANKING INFO









SAFETY PERSON INFO





SAFETY PERSON INFO

MTR VEH/LICENSE

NOT PUBLIC RECORD



SAFETY PERSON INFO

SAFETY PERSON
INFO

SAFETY PERSON INFO

SAFETY PERSON INFO











SAFETY PERSON INFO







SAFETY PERSON INFO

SAFETY PERSON INFO





SAFETY PERSON INFO





SAFETY PERSON INFO















SSN
SSN

SAFETY PERSON INFO































SSN



















Total Number of Redactions in Document: 35

Redaction Reasons by Page

Page Reason Description Occurrences

1 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

4 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

4 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

5 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

2

13 ACCT# BANKING 
INFO

The account and/or banking information 
has been redacted as this information does
not meet the definition of a “record” as 
defined in O.R.C. 149.011(G) because it 
does not serve to document the 
organization, functions, policies, 
decisions, procedures, operations or other 
activities of the City of Cleveland. State ex 
rel. Dispatch Printing Co. v. Johnson, 106 
Ohio St.3d 160, 2005-Ohio-4384.

1

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 1:09:01 PM
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Page Reason Description Occurrences

17 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

19 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

19 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

19 NOT PUBLIC 
RECORD

Not a public record as it does not 
document the business of the city 1

20 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

5

25 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 1:09:01 PM
Redaction Log
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27 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

2

28 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

2

30 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

32 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

33 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 1:09:01 PM
Redaction Log



Page Reason Description Occurrences

33 SAFETY FAMILY 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank 
account, debit card, charge card or credit 
card number, or emergency telephone 
number has been redacted based upon 
O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

2

39 SSN

Social security numbers and federal 
identification numbers have been redacted
under State ex rel. Beacon Journal 
Publishing Co. v. Akron, 70 Ohio St.3d 605
(1994).

2

39 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

54 SSN

Social security numbers and federal 
identification numbers have been redacted
under State ex rel. Beacon Journal 
Publishing Co. v. Akron, 70 Ohio St.3d 605
(1994).

1

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 1:09:01 PM
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Redaction Reasons by Exemption

Reason Description Pages
(Count)

ACCT# BANKING INFO

The account and/or banking information has
been redacted as this information does not 
meet the definition of a “record” as defined 
in O.R.C. 149.011(G) because it does not 
serve to document the organization, 
functions, policies, decisions, procedures, 
operations or other activities of the City of 
Cleveland. State ex rel. Dispatch Printing 
Co. v. Johnson, 106 Ohio St.3d 160, 
2005-Ohio-4384.

13(1)

MTR VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, license 
plate numbers, VIN numbers, and the 
entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et seq. 
(Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

4(1)
19(1)

NOT PUBLIC RECORD Not a public record as it does not document 
the business of the city

19(1)

SAFETY FAMILY INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank account,
debit card, charge card or credit card 
number, or emergency telephone number 
has been redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

33(2)

SAFETY PERSON INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7)(a) 
thru (e).

1(1)
4(4)
5(2)
17(1)
19(1)
20(5)
25(1)
27(2)
28(2)
30(1)
32(1)
33(4)
39(1)

SSN

Social security numbers and federal 
identification numbers have been redacted 
under State ex rel. Beacon Journal 
Publishing Co. v. Akron, 70 Ohio St.3d 605 
(1994).

39(2)
54(1)

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 1:09:01 PM
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Total Number of Redactions in Document: 81

Redaction Reasons by Page

Page Reason Description Occurrences

1 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

5

2 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

4 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

8 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
Redaction Log



Page Reason Description Occurrences

12 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

14 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

18 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

18 NON-RESPONSIV
E

This material is non-responsive to your 
request. 1

19 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

19 NON-RESPONSIV
E

This material is non-responsive to your 
request. 2

20 NON-RESPONSIV
E

This material is non-responsive to your 
request. 2

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
Redaction Log



Page Reason Description Occurrences

21 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

6

21 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

22 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

23 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

24 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
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25 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

27 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

29 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

6

29 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

2

30 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

31 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
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31 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

1

31 NOT PUBLIC 
RECORD

Not a public record as it does not 
document the business of the city 1

33 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

33 SAFETY FAMILY 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank 
account, debit card, charge card or credit 
card number, or emergency telephone 
number has been redacted based upon 
O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

2

34 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

2

38 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

2

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
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39 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

41 NON-RESPONSIV
E

This material is non-responsive to your 
request. 2

42 NON-RESPONSIV
E

This material is non-responsive to your 
request. 2

44 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

5

45 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

3

Redaction Date:  4/16/2021 12:53:04 PM
Redaction Log



Redaction Reasons by Exemption

Reason Description Pages
(Count)

MTR VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, license 
plate numbers, VIN numbers, and the 
entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et seq. 
(Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

21(1)
22(1)
29(2)
30(1)
31(1)
34(2)

NON-RESPONSIVE This material is non-responsive to your 
request.

19(2)
18(1)
20(2)
41(2)
42(2)

NOT PUBLIC RECORD Not a public record as it does not document 
the business of the city

31(1)

SAFETY FAMILY INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank account,
debit card, charge card or credit card 
number, or emergency telephone number 
has been redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

33(2)

SAFETY PERSON INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7)(a) 
thru (e).

1(5)
2(4)
4(3)
8(3)
12(3)
14(4)
18(1)
19(1)
21(6)
23(1)
24(3)
25(1)
27(3)
29(6)
31(1)
33(3)
38(2)
39(3)
44(5)
45(3)
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Total Number of Redactions in Document: 42

Redaction Reasons by Page

Page Reason Description Occurrences

1 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

2 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

3 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

4 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

5 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

6 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

7 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

8 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

9 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

10 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

11 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

12 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

13 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

14 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

15 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

16 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

17 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

18 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

19 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

20 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1
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Page Reason Description Occurrences

21 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

23 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

24 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

25 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

5

27 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

28 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

29 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

30 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

31 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

32 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

33 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

35 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

36 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

37 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

38 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

39 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

40 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

41 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

Redaction Date:  4/21/2021 12:10:19 PM
Redaction Log



Redaction Reasons by Exemption

Reason Description Pages
(Count)

SAFETY PERSON INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7)(a) 
thru (e).

25(5)

TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 

1(1)
2(1)
3(1)
4(1)
5(1)
6(1)
7(1)
8(1)
9(1)
10(1)
11(1)
12(1)
13(1)
14(1)
15(1)
16(1)
17(1)
18(1)
19(1)
20(1)
21(1)
23(1)
24(1)
27(1)
28(1)
29(1)
30(1)
31(1)
32(1)
33(1)
35(1)
36(1)
37(1)
38(1)
39(1)
40(1)
41(1)
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Total Number of Redactions in Document: 28

Redaction Reasons by Page

Page Reason Description Occurrences

1 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

2 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

6 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

14 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

15 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

16 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

17 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

18 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

19 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

20 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

21 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

22 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

36 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

36 MTR 
VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, 
license plate numbers, VIN numbers, and 
the entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et 
seq. (Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

1

Redaction Date:  4/21/2021 12:16:45 PM
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Page Reason Description Occurrences

36 SAFETY FAMILY 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank 
account, debit card, charge card or credit 
card number, or emergency telephone 
number has been redacted based upon 
O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

1

37 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

42 SAFETY PERSON 
INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7)(a) thru (e).

4

48 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

50 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

51 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

55 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

58 TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 1

Redaction Date:  4/21/2021 12:16:45 PM
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Redaction Reasons by Exemption

Reason Description Pages
(Count)

MTR VEH/LICENSE

Motor vehicle/driver record information 
(including driver’s license numbers, license 
plate numbers, VIN numbers, and the 
entirety of a driver’s license including 
photos) pursuant to   18 U.S.C. 7521, et seq. 
(Driver’s Privacy Protection Act).

36(1)

SAFETY FAMILY INFO

Information regarding the person’s name, 
residential address, name and address of 
employer, social security number, 
residential telephone number, bank account,
debit card, charge card or credit card 
number, or emergency telephone number 
has been redacted based upon O.R.C. 
149.43(A)(7) and (A)(8)(f).

36(1)

SAFETY PERSON INFO

Information regarding the person’s 
residential address, participation in 
employee assistance program, social 
security number, residential telephone 
number, bank account, debit card, charge 
card or credit card number, emergency 
telephone number, any medical 
information, and/or charitable or 
employment benefit deductions has been 
redacted based upon O.R.C. 149.43(A)(7)(a) 
thru (e).

36(4)
42(4)

TRADE SECRET Records constituting “trade secrets” have 
been withheld under O.R.C. 1333.61(D). 

1(1)
2(1)
6(1)
14(1)
15(1)
16(1)
17(1)
18(1)
19(1)
20(1)
21(1)
22(1)
37(1)
48(1)
50(1)
51(1)
55(1)
58(1)
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C o m p l e t i o n s 
Type:  
Comple t ions
Run Date :  
Apr 21,  2021 8:29 AM
Shared  wi th :  
Not  Shared  
Filters: 
Users :  1  se lec ted
Type: All  Assignments
User Status: Active, Offline

F i r s t  N a m e L a s t  N a m e E m p l o y e e  I D A s s i g n m e n t  N a m e A s s i g n m e n t  T y p e A s s i g n m e n t  M e t h o d C o m p l e t i o n  D a t e C o m p l e t i o n  T i m e D u r a t i o n  ( h o u r s )

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Intro to TargetSolut ions from
the Chief

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 2 / 1 3 / 2 0 1 8 11:39 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 TargetSolut ions  User
Overview Video

TargetSolut ions
Training

Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 2 / 1 3 / 2 0 1 8 11:51 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Use of  Force Training 2017 Use of  Force Self Assign 0 7 / 1 2 / 2 0 1 7 05:00 AM 8
Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Use of  Force Training 2017 Use of  Force Self Assign 0 7 / 1 3 / 2 0 1 7 05:00 AM 8

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 ASP PP Training Staff
E x a m p l e s

Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 4 / 0 2 / 2 0 1 8 10:45 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2018 CPT First Aid CPR
Recert if icat ion

Training Record  Comple t ions 0 3 / 1 4 / 2 0 1 8 01:00 PM 8

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2018 CEW Recertif ication 2018 In-service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 4 / 0 2 / 2 0 1 8 10:49 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Bias Free Classroom Training 2018 In-service Record  Comple t ions 0 8 / 0 2 / 2 0 1 8 09:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 C o m m u n i t y  E n g a g e m e n t
Problem Solving Training

2018 In-service Record  Comple t ions 0 7 / 3 1 / 2 0 1 8 09:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Crisis  Intervention Classroom
Training 2nd Half

2018 In-service Record  Comple t ions 0 8 / 0 1 / 2 0 1 8 09:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Cops n Cribs Video Training Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 7 / 1 7 / 2 0 1 8 10:36 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Mobile Computer  Aided
Dispatch Training

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 7 / 1 7 / 2 0 1 8 10:37 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Patrol Rifle Training and
Re-Certification

Training Record  Comple t ions 0 9 / 1 7 / 2 0 1 8 06:59 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2018 Bias-Free GPO Exam 2018 In-service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 9 / 0 4 / 2 0 1 8 05:53 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Traff ic  Crash Report
Update  Training

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 1 / 1 0 / 2 0 1 9 07:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Session II  Use of Force 2019 In-Service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 4 / 0 1 / 2 0 1 9 05:00 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Session I I  Community
Engagement  Problem-Solv ing

2019 In-Service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 4 / 0 2 / 2 0 1 9 05:00 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Enroll STO/FTO Training Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 6 / 3 0 / 2 0 1 9 07:23 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4
Galls Clothing Allowance
Account  Se tup  and  Order ing
Training

Training
Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t 0 6 / 3 0 / 2 0 1 9 07:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Use of Force Policy
U p d a t e s

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 6 / 3 0 / 2 0 1 9 07:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019  Sea rch  and  Se izu re
Pre-load Training

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 0 / 2 4 / 2 0 1 9 08:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Session III Bias-Free
Training

2019 In-Service Record  Comple t ions 1 0 / 3 0 / 2 0 1 9 05:00 AM 4

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Session III  Search &
Seizure Training

2019 In-Service Record  Comple t ions 1 0 / 3 1 / 2 0 1 9 05:00 AM 8



Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 Session III Crisis
Intervention Training (CIT)

2019 In-Service Record  Comple t ions 1 0 / 3 0 / 2 0 1 9 09:30 AM 4

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Police Priority Dispatch
System Tra in ing

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 6 / 0 3 / 2 0 2 0 10:45 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Force  Inves t igat ion Team
GPO - 2.01.07

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 6 / 0 3 / 2 0 2 0 11:15 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2020 CPT Session I - Pistol /
Shotgun /  CEW Training

2020 In-Service Record  Comple t ions 0 7 / 2 9 / 2 0 2 0 05:00 AM 8

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Data Collection Training
Session I

Training Record  Comple t ions 1 2 / 1 0 / 2 0 1 9 10:00 PM 2

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Misconduct Policies Training Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 2 / 1 2 / 2 0 2 0 07:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2 0 1 9  W e a r a b l e  C a m e r a
System (WCS) Policy Update

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 2 / 0 3 / 2 0 1 9 08:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019  Employee  Sa fe ty  and
Heal th  Handbook Training

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 2 / 0 3 / 2 0 1 9 07:45 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2019 CEW Recertif ication 2019 In-Service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 2 / 0 3 / 2 0 1 9 07:57 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Mass  Gather ings  Prohibi ted Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 1 8 / 2 0 2 0 03:15 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Suicide Prevention for Law
Enfo rcemen t

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 1 8 / 2 0 2 0 03:30 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Coronavirus  -  Update Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 1 8 / 2 0 2 0 03:15 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4
Summons in Lieu of Arrest  -
Nonviolent  Misdemeanors
(DN 20-104)

Policy Review
Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t 0 4 / 1 6 / 2 0 2 0 03:00 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Sho tSpo t t e r  Respond
Application

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 0 / 0 1 / 2 0 2 0 04:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Social Media Policy and
Usage GPO

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 9 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 0 03:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4
Communicat ion with Limited
English Proficiency (LEP) or
Deaf GPO

Policy Review
Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t 0 9 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 0 03:15 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Mandatory LEADS
News le t t e r s

LEADS Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 9 / 2 5 / 2 0 2 0 12:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Mandatory TAC In-Service Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 9 / 2 5 / 2 0 2 0 12:15 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 2020 Conducted Elect r ica l
Weapon (CEW) Training

2020 In-Service Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 9 / 2 6 / 2 0 2 0 03:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4
Arres tee  Res t ra in t ,
Transpor t ,  and Supervis ion
GPO

Policy Review
Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t 1 1 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 0 01:45 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Bomb Threats  GPO Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 1 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 0 02:15 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4
Bomb Squad  and  Improv ised
Explosive Device Protocols
GPO

Policy Review
Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t 1 1 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 0 02:00 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Clandest ine Laborator ies  GPO Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 1 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 0 02:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 ShotSpot ter  Ins ight
Application

Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 1 / 1 1 / 2 0 2 0 01:30 PM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Interactions With Youth GPO Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 2 0 / 2 0 2 1 11:30 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Sexual Assault Kit Tracking
Sys tem,  DN 21-049

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 2 0 / 2 0 2 1 11:15 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Interaction With TIGN
Individuals GPO

Policy Review Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 3 / 2 0 / 2 0 2 1 11:15 AM



Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Grenadier  Operator  Training Training Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

0 1 / 2 1 / 2 0 2 1 05:50 AM

Daniel Piper 1 9 5 6 6 4 Recording Offsite Training SCORM Course Crea t e  New
Ass ignmen t

1 0 / 1 6 / 2 0 1 8 01:38 AM . 5
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