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Investigative Activity: Prior LE contacts and social media  

Involves: Jazmir Tucker (S) 

Activity Date: 01/02/2025 

Activity Location: BCI Richfield 

Authoring Agent: SA Jonathan Lieber 

  
Narrative: 

On Friday, December 6, 2024, Ohio Bureau of Criminal Investigation (BCI) Special Agent 

(SA) Jon Lieber (Lieber) compiled background information on Jazmir Tucker (Tucker), a 

subject involved in the incident on November 28, 2024. The information included 

researching past police reports involving the subject, searching criminal history 

records, court records (if applicable), open/closed-source database inquiries, and 

social media posts. The information gathered was obtained from the BCI Criminal 

Intelligence Unit, Akron Police Department, and the Summit County Juvenile Court. 

SA Lieber reviewed the information and noted the following: 

  

Prior Police Encounters: 

Tucker was involved in an incident on September 20, 2024, at North High School 

(Akron PD incident #2024-00113551). According to the report, Tucker and another 

juvenile male were charged with disorderly conduct.  

 

Computerized Criminal History (CCH) and/or Court Records: 

On January 17, 2025, SA Lieber received records from the Summit County Juvenile 

Court. The records consisted of 5 pages (including fax cover sheet and records 

request).  

 

 

. 
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Database Searches: 

Tucker was found to have the following accounts: 

 Twitter/X: https://x.com/lilmaybak 

 TikTok: https://www.tiktok.com/@lil_maybak 

 Cashapp: https://cash.app/$lilmaybak 

 Instagram: username “lil_maybak” The account appeared to be deleted. 

 Roblox: ID: 4976197360 / username: lil_maybak  

(URL: https://www.roblox.com/users/4976197360/profile) 

 Xbox: ID: 2535467233342477 

 Playstation Network: 2042630931713546500 

No posts had been made on the Twitter or TikTok accounts. 

 

The documents received relative to Jazmir Tucker are attached to this report for further 

review, except for any prohibited LEADS/CCH reports which were disposed of 

according to applicable policies and procedures.  

 

References: 

None 

Attachments: 

1. 24-113551 Case Report (Jazmir Tucker Prior Incident) 

2. Summit Co. Juvenile Court record 

3. Twitter X (lilmaybak) 

4. TikTok (lil_maybak) 

5. Cash App ($lilmaybak) 

6. Roblox 

7. Xbox 

8. Playstation Network 



2024-00113551

Disorderly Conduct9/20/2024 11:27

985 GORGE BLVD09/20/2024 11:21 09/20/2024 11:22 Akron, OH 44310

2917.11
Disorderly Conduct01 Completed1
A600
Use Of Force02 Completed1

Juvenile
Wade, Dae'ShaunSuspect

1604/13/2008 2213 SW 23rd ST AKRON, OH 44314

BrownBrown6'2" 100Black Male 6'2" 100

Juvenile
Tucker, JazmirSuspect

1503/11/2009 853 Amherst ST AKRON, OH 44311

BrownBrown6'0" 115Black Male 6'0" 115

(216)225-3297

Business
Society,Victim

217 High ST AKRON, OH 44308
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I, Ofc. Johnson, was working as the SRO at North CLC. At around 1115 hours I started toward the 
lunch room to work lunch security. 

Around 1121 hours, I could see the suspects, Dae'Shaun Wade and Jazmir Tucker in the south 
part of the cafeteria. I could see Wade and Tucker start getting in each other's face and begin a 
verbal fight. I ran over giving verbal directions in an attempt to de-escalate Wade and Tucker. I 
grabbed Wade and told him the fight was over and to stop. As I escorted Wade away, I told Tucker 
to back off and go away. Wade tried to push me away and walk toward Tucker in an attempt to 
fight him. I continued holding on to Wade and told him again, it was over and he needed to stop. 
Wade tried to push me out of the way a second time. Due to Wade trying to get past me to fight 
Tucker, I performed a take down move on Wade and placed him on the floor. Wade was placed in 
hand cuffs. As I was apprehending Wade, Tucker came over to us and stood over us. I was 
concerned that Tucker was going to try to stomp or kick Wade. School safety team intervened and 
pulled Tucker away before he could inflict any harm. Wade was taken out of the cafeteria and 
placed in room 108.

I advised Wade on his Miranda warnings. Wade stated Tucker was being disrespectful in the 
hallway outside the cafeteria. Wade and Tucker got into a verbal fight. Wade stated I came and 
started to separate them. Wade saw Tucker drop his backpack and that's what made Wade try to 
push past me. Wade stated I took him to the ground and placed him in handcuffs. 

Tucker was no longer on scene and I was unable to interview him. 

In the Lunch room, the fight was seen on camera. In the video you can see both Wade and Tucker 
get into a verbal fight. I came in to separate both Wade and Tucker. As I was separating Wade and 
Tucker, Tucker pushed Wade. Wade tried to push past me to get to tucker. I grabbed Wade and 
begin to walk backwards with him to stop the fight. Wade is observed trying to push past me a 
second time. I do a take down move on Wade and take him to the floor. Tucker came over and 
stood over top of Wade and placed his right foot on Wade's right hip. Tucker and Wade were 
escorted out of the lunch room. 

Both students were charged with disorderly conduct. Both students parent's were contacted and 
advised of this incident and the charges. Both students were sent home to their parents. Sgt. White 
was notified of this and was on scene. Wade did not report any injuries and EMS was not called. I 
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am not authorized to wear BWC while on this assignment however the incident was captured on 
school surveillance and uploaded to evidence.com. 
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