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On October 19, 2024, the Dayton Police Department requested assistance from the Ohio
Bureau of Criminal Investigation (BCI) at the scene of an Officer-Involved Critical Incident
(OICI) located at 1273 Rosedale, Dayton, Ohio. As part of that investigation, Special Agent
Perry Roeser (SA Roeser) was requested to look into the facts and circumstances of a hit-and-
run private property traffic crash earlier in the day, at approximately 0820 hours. The owner,
Tenley Taghi, and her son, Anthony Reedy, reported after they saw the news coverage of the
OICI, they recognized the involved subject's vehicle as the one that crashed into their parked
vehicles in their driveway earlier in the morning.

The Dayton Police Department, Officer Muradov, arrived at the private property crash, 1367
Philadelphia Dr. Dayton, Ohio, at 1352 hours for the crash report, case number 2410190027.
Witness Anthony Reedy (Reedy) reported that outside the property, he saw a Buick sedan pass
his residence and stop in the roadway just past his driveway. Reedy reported the Buick then
reversed into his driveway, "gunned it," and struck the parked Chevrolet Trailblazer. Reedy
reported he had to jump out of the way of the Buick to avoid being hit. The Trailblazer was
pushed into a Saturn vehicle that was also parked in front of the Trailblazer. Witness Tenley
Taghi (Taghi), who was positioned in the driver's seat of the Saturn when the crash occurred,
saw her son chase the Buick on foot as it turned eastward onto Princeton Avenue after the
collision.

On October 31, 2024, at 1255 hours, SA Roeser met with Taghi at her residence. Taghi
explained while she and her son were trying to get her car started (dead battery) in the
driveway, a car pulled up in front of her house. She said the car had a "doughnut tire"
installed, which she saw on the front driver's side of the car with damage. Taghi then said the
vehicle reversed into her driveway, "slammed into the gas, " hit the Chevrolet, and then into
her Saturn. Taghi said her son jumped out of the vehicle's path just before it hit her car.
Taghi said the vehicle exited her property and traveled down Princeton Avenue with her son,
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who gave chase on foot.

SA Roeser asked if the driver of the vehicle was provoked in any way. She said no.

SA Roeser asked if they recognized the car's driver or if they had ever seen him before. She
said no.

SA Roeser asked if the driver made any statements to either of them after the crash. She said
no.

SA Roeser asked if the driver exited his car after the crash. She said no.

Taghi was asked how she could connect the vehicle to the OICI. She said that after the crash,
she had called 911 for assistance. Shortly after calling 911, she heard all the police cars with
their sirens on, thinking this guy, who just struck her vehicles, tried to kill someone. Taghi
stated about half an hour after calling 911, she heard gunfire in the neighborhood. She said
the incident location of the OICI was two blocks from her residence. SA Roeser asked if she
could describe the driver of the vehicle. She said he was a Black male driver, unsure of what
he wore.

Taghi explained that later in the day, she and her son saw the news coverage of the OICI and
recognized the Buick on television as the car that crashed into her vehicle.

The interview with Taghi concluded at 1304 hours and was audio recorded. See attachment
#1 for a copy of the recording.

Attachments:Attachments:

Attachment # 01: 2024-10-31 / Tenley Taghi interview
Attachment # 02: DPD OH1 crash report
Attachment # 03: Crash incident report
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Exhibit 1

Included as a separate file.
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